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Clinical Trial Registration: A Statement from the International 
Committee of Medical Journal Editors

 

Altruism and trust lie at the heart of research on hu-
man subjects. Altruistic individuals volunteer for re-
search because they trust that their participation will
contribute to improved health for others and that
researchers will minimize risks to participants. In
return for the altruism and trust that make clinical
research possible, the research enterprise has an ob-
ligation to conduct research ethically and to report
it honestly. Honest reporting begins with revealing
the existence of all clinical studies, even those that
reflect unfavorably on a research sponsor’s product.

Unfortunately, selective reporting of trials does
occur, and it distorts the body of evidence available
for clinical decision-making. Researchers (and jour-
nal editors) are generally most enthusiastic about
the publication of trials that show either a large ef-
fect of a new treatment (positive trials) or equiva-
lence of two approaches to treatment (non-inferior-
ity trials). Researchers (and journals) typically are
less excited about trials that show that a new treat-
ment is inferior to standard treatment (negative tri-
als) and even less interested in trials that are neither
clearly positive nor clearly negative, since inconclu-
sive trials will not in themselves change practice. Ir-
respective of their scientific interest, trial results that
place financial interests at risk are particularly likely
to remain unpublished and hidden from public view.
The interests of the sponsor or authors notwith-
standing, anyone should be able to learn of any tri-
al’s existence and its important characteristics.

The case against selective reporting is particular-
ly compelling for research that tests interventions
that could enter mainstream clinical practice. Rath-
er than a single trial, it is usually a body of evidence,
consisting of many studies, that changes medical
practice. When research sponsors or investigators
conceal the presence of selected trials, these stud-
ies cannot influence the thinking of patients, clini-

cians, other researchers, and experts who write
practice guidelines or decide on insurance-coverage
policy. If all trials are registered in a public repository
at their inception, every trial’s existence is part of the
public record and the many stakeholders in clinical
research can explore the full range of clinical evi-
dence. We are far from this ideal at present, since
trial registration is largely voluntary, registry data
sets and public access to them varies, and registries
contain only a small proportion of trials. In this edi-
torial, published simultaneously in all member jour-
nals, the International Committee of Medical Jour-
nal Editors (ICMJE) proposes comprehensive trials
registration as a solution to the problem of selective
awareness and announces that all eleven ICMJE
member journals will adopt a trials-registration pol-
icy to promote this goal.

The ICMJE member journals will require, as a
condition of consideration for publication, registra-
tion in a public trials registry. Trials must register at
or before the onset of patient enrollment. This pol-
icy applies to any clinical trial starting enrollment
after July 1, 2005. For trials that began enrollment
before this date, the ICMJE member journals will
require registration by September 13, 2005, before
considering the trial for publication. We speak only
for ourselves, but we encourage editors of other bio-
medical journals to adopt similar policies. For this
purpose, the ICMJE defines a clinical trial as any re-
search project that prospectively assigns human
subjects to intervention or comparison groups to
study the cause-and-effect relationship between a
medical intervention and a health outcome. Studies
designed for other purposes, such as to study phar-
macokinetics or major toxicity (e.g., phase 1 trials),
would be exempt.

The ICMJE does not advocate one particular reg-
istry, but its member journals will require authors
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to register their trial in a registry that meets several
criteria. The registry must be accessible to the public
at no charge. It must be open to all prospective reg-
istrants and managed by a not-for-profit organiza-
tion. There must be a mechanism to ensure the va-
lidity of the registration data, and the registry should
be electronically searchable. An acceptable registry
must include at minimum the following informa-
tion: a unique identifying number, a statement of
the intervention (or interventions) and comparison
(or comparisons) studied, a statement of the study
hypothesis, definitions of the primary and second-
ary outcome measures, eligibility criteria, key trial
dates (registration date, anticipated or actual start
date, anticipated or actual date of last follow-up,
planned or actual date of closure to data entry, and
date trial data considered complete), target number
of subjects, funding source, and contact informa-
tion for the principal investigator. To our knowl-
edge, at present, only www.clinicaltrials.gov, spon-
sored by the United States National Library of
Medicine, meets these requirements; there may be
other registries, now or in the future, that meet all
these requirements.

Registration is only part of the means to an end;
that end is full transparency with respect to perfor-
mance and reporting of clinical trials. Research
sponsors may argue that public registration of clin-
ical trials will result in unnecessary bureaucratic de-
lays and destroy their competitive edge by allowing
competitors full access to their research plans. We
argue that enhanced public confidence in the re-
search enterprise will compensate for the costs of
full disclosure. Patients who volunteer to participate
in clinical trials deserve to know that their contri-
bution to improving human health will be available
to inform health care decisions. The knowledge

made possible by their collective altruism must be
accessible to everyone. Required trial registration
will advance this goal.
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Should Parents Speak with a Dying Child 
about Impending Death?

 

Lawrence Wolfe, M.D.

 

In 1985, a reading of Patrick Irvine’s essay in the

 

Journal

 

 about his participation in the funerals of his
patients

 

1

 

 eased concerns of my own about attending
the funerals of my young patients who have suc-
cumbed to cancer. At these services, I have heard
“Suffer the little children . . .” from the New Tes-
tament and the 23rd Psalm from the Old Testament

many times. These words are regularly chosen to
help alleviate the inconsolable grief that follows the
death of a child. The presence of the physician at
these funerals can honor the struggle of the family
and the value and courage of the child. My partici-
pation in these observances serves to remind me of
the importance of helping families to deal with the
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